
$219,900 - 267 Seminole Trail, CRESTVIEW
MLS® #953764 

$219,900
3 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 1,082 sqft
Detached Single Family on 0.23 Acres

JERNIGAN S/D, CRESTVIEW, FL

This brand new listing in Crestview, FL, is a
completely renovated home, making it an ideal
choice for a first-time home buyer, especially
with its eligibility for 100% financing. The home
boasts a 2019 roof, new water heater, updated
wiring, AC, and plumbing throughout. The fully
remodeled three-bedroom house features
elegant finishing touches at a great price.
Inside, there are two living spaces and a
screened-in Florida room. The kitchen is
equipped with all-new white cabinets,
butcher-block countertops, a new stove,
dishwasher, microwave, sink, and kitchen
hardware. The home is adorned with gorgeous
trim around the windows, allowing ample
natural light to fill the space. New flooring,
lighting, and ceiling fans have been installed
throughout.The bathroom includes everything
brand new, a double vanity with new gold
hardware, a tiled shower, a new tub, and
marble counters. Additional features include a
single-car garage with a new opener and extra
storage, a privacy-fenced yard, and a storage
shed. Shopping and dining options are just
minutes away.

Built in 1955

Essential Information

MLS® # 953764

Price $219,900

Bedrooms 3



Bathrooms 1.00

Full Baths 1

Square Footage 1,082

Acres 0.23

Year Built 1955

Type Detached Single Family

Sub-Type Detached Single Family

Style Traditional

Status Active

Community Information

Address 267 Seminole Trail

Area Crestview Area

Subdivision JERNIGAN S/D

City CRESTVIEW

County OKALOOSA

State FL

Zip Code 32536

Amenities

Utilities Public Sewer Available, Public Water Available

Parking Spaces 1

Parking Garage

# of Garages 1

Interior

Interior Features Ceiling Crwn Molding, Washer/Dryer Hookup

Heating Heat: Central Electric

Cooling A/C: Central Electric

# of Stories 1

Exterior

Exterior Block

Exterior Features Deck Open, Fenced Privacy, Porch Covered

Roof Block

School Information

Elementary NORTHWOOD

Middle DAVIDSON



High CRESTVIEW

Additional Information

Zoning Residential Single Family

HOA Fees 0.00

Listing Details

Listing Office Coldwell Banker Realty
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