
$300,000 - 5581 Peach Dr, Pace
MLS® #954631 

$300,000
3 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,842 sqft
Detached Single Family on 0.19 Acres

WOODLANDS, Pace, FL

Welcome to 5581 Peach Dr, a stunning
3-bedroom, 2-bathroom home located in the
heart of Milton, Florida. Built in 2017, this 1842
square foot residence boasts a wide open floor
plan with high ceilings and recessed lighting,
creating a bright and inviting atmosphere. The
kitchen is equipped with matching stainless
steel appliances, and the home includes a new
matching Samsung washer and dryer. The
master suite offers a luxurious retreat with a
tray ceiling, dual vanities, an alcove tub, and a
huge walk-in closet. The home is equipped
with hurricane shutters, adding extra peace of
mind. Situated in a peaceful neighborhood
with amazing neighbors, this property does not
require flood insurance and has low HOA
fees.The community features a playground
and park, perfect for outdoor activities. The
huge fenced backyard provides extra privacy
and includes a covered back patio that can
easily be enclosed. Milton is centrally located,
offering easy access to I-10, Pensacola, and is
less than an hour from the world's most
beautiful beaches. Experience the perfect
blend of comfort and convenience at 5581
Peach Dr.

Built in 2017

Essential Information

MLS® # 954631

Price $300,000



Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 2

Square Footage 1,842

Acres 0.19

Year Built 2017

Type Detached Single Family

Sub-Type Detached Single Family

Style Craftsman Style

Status Active

Community Information

Address 5581 Peach Dr

Area North Santa Rosa County

Subdivision WOODLANDS

City Pace

County SANTA ROSA

State FL

Zip Code 32571

Amenities

Amenities Playground, Picnic Area

Utilities Public Sewer Available, Public Water Available

Parking Garage: Attached

Interior

Interior Features Lighting Recessed

Appliances Dishwasher, Disposal, Dryer, Microwave, Stove/Oven Electric, Washer

Heating Heat: Central Electric

Cooling A/C: Central Electric

# of Stories 1

Exterior

Exterior Frame

Exterior Features Patio Covered, Porch Covered

Construction Frame

School Information

Elementary Pea Ridge



Middle Avalon

High Pace

Additional Information

Zoning Residential Single Family

HOA Fees 250.00

HOA Fees Freq. Annually

Listing Details

Listing Office LPT Realty LLC
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